
We are Historians…



Exciting launch days and 
school trips to fully immerse 
children in their learning:



Reception:

Comparing old and new, then 
and now. Comparing our own 
experiences with those of our 
family members.



Observing changes that 
happen over time (plants, 
animals, the weather, humans).



Year 1:

Exploring timelines as a way of 
representing key historical
events from past to present.



Asking questions and making 
simple comparisons.



Recalling historical facts.

Making comparisons between 
the past and present.



Year 2:

Asking historical questions.



Using sources and artefacts to 
find answers to questions. 



Using sources and artefacts to 
find answers to questions. 



Making timelines to represent 
the chronology of  significant 
figures’ lives.

Making comparisons  between 
key historical figures.



First person accounts.



Year 3:

Using a range of sources and 
artefacts to ask historical 
questions.



Using a range of sources and 
artefacts to answer historical 
questions. 



Deducing information from a 
range of sources and artefacts.



Deducing information from a 
range of sources and artefacts.



Making timelines to represent 
the chronology of key historical 
events over time.


